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Abstract 
This study investigates how firms proactively or reactively launch (Venkatraman & Prescott, 1990) their strategic 
actions in response to environmental changes, particularly to deregulatory and technological changes. Strategic 
initiatives including mergers and acquisitions to deal with firms’ uncertain competitive environments have been 
regarded as key strategic actions. This study analyzes the nature of firms’ willingness to take strategic actions in 
response to the key environmental changes in the telecom service industry. The natures of environmental 
changes, broadly defined as deregulatory and technological changes in this research’s domain, trigger firms to 
take on strategic actions both proactively and reactively.  

Keywords: strategic actions, environmental changes, proactive actions, reactive actions 
1. Introduction 
This study investigates how firms adjust (Venkatraman & Prescott, 1990) their strategic actions in response to 
environmental changes, particularly to deregulatory and technological changes. Strategic initiatives, such as 
strategic partnerships and corporate mergers and acquisitions to deal with firms’ uncertain competitive 
environments have been frequently regarded as key strategic actions. The question of what are antecedents of 
firms’ strategic actions has been one of central research domain in the field of strategic management (Nadkarni 
& Barr, 2008). This study focuses on nature of firms’ willingness to take strategic actions in response to the key 
environmental changes in the telecom service industry. For conducting an empirical research, this study 
hypothesizes that environmental changes, broadly defined as deregulatory and technological changes, trigger 
firms to take on strategic actions both proactively and reactively.  
Due to the lengthy deregulatory processes (Kim & Prescott, 2005) and the extensive nature of infrastructure 
investment decisions during the process, incumbents in the telecom service industry are better equipped with 
appropriate strategic actions in adapting to deregulatory changes. It means that incumbents tend to be preemptive 
on, to great extents, incoming regulatory changes. On the other hand, in the event of technological changes 
which constantly evolve to more advanced levels, incumbents are inclined to exploit the already invested 
technologies before they actually commit themselves to any upcoming new technologies. As a result, incumbents 
are more reactive in adapting to technological changes. Furthermore, investing on new infrastructure such as 
telecom networks requires firms to take significant times to vest on new technological standards. As a result, 
incumbents take their strategic actions rather reactively until new technological changes are fully acknowledged 
in the market. 

The empirical setting in this study is the US telecom industry from 1994 to 2004. During these times, the 
industry has experienced major environmental changes driven by a series of deregulatory events and the 
proliferation of new telecommunication technology services. All these environmental changes have redefined the 
fast-growing industry structure and competition, and reshuffled the key industry players tremendously. Also, 
service convergences between telecom and broadcasting sectors made the industry boundaries more ambiguous 
and complex. Consequently all of these major environmental changes lowered entry barriers and caused strategic 
challenges to various service providers. In response to these changes, key telecom service providers have taken 
various strategic actions, including mergers and acquisitions and strategic alliances. Generalizing from the above 
industry events, this study investigates that the nature (proactiveness vs. reactiveness) of a firm’s strategic 
actions will be determined by the fact that environmental changes are driven either by deregulatory or 
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technological initiatives.  

2. Literature Review  

Environmental changes promote organizational transformation by redrawing industry boundaries, shifting the 
scope of permissible strategic activities for incumbents and new entrants, and changing incentives for certain 
strategic behaviors (Delmas & Russo, 2005; Miller & Chen, 1994). On the other hand, the choice of strategic 
actions initiated by organizations will constrain the way the environment unfolds. The firm’s ability to select the 
right mix of strategic actions in a dynamic environmental condition can be a very powerful tool to outperform 
others. Several theoretical frameworks covering such interactions with different assumptions will be surveyed. 

Insights from industrial organization (IO) economics have been extremely important in developing strategic 
management models of how a firm achieves sustainable competitive advantage (Grimm et al., 2006). IO 
economics provides direct insights into how firms can obtain competitive advantages through strategic 
positioning in the context of industry structure and pursuing strategies that are appropriate to specific industry 
structure (Grimm et al., 2006). IO economics theory argues that a firm’s competitive advantage is mainly 
influenced by industry structure and a firm’s strategic actions can be emphasized as the firm’s willingness to 
position the firm’s low cost or differentiation strategies within an industry structure (Porter, 1980). Therefore, 
industry structures have predominantly influenced the natures of strategic decisions.  

In case of scale-based industries such as wireless industry, the industry structure would favor the incumbents’ 
leveraging of their market dominance even after deregulatory or technological changes. Representing a more 
extreme flavor of environmental selection on organizational forms, organizational ecology argues that 
environmental and market conditions set the stage for certain firms to outperform others by virtue of their market 
compatibility rather than by their internal efficiency (Carroll, 1993). However, even among incumbents, 
environmental changes influence each firm’s strategic behavior in different ways. Both IO economics and 
organizational ecology do not explain the heterogeneity of incumbents’ strategic behaviors in response to 
environmental changes. 

The strategic choice perspective (Miles & Snow 1978) argues that strategic adaptation is a dynamic process 
subject to both managerial actions and environmental forces. It implies that management should take into 
account the multiple ways that firms can interact with their environments through the process of mutual 
adaptation between the organization and its environmental domain. Chakravarthy (1991) provided a framework 
for connecting strategic adaptation to deregulation. Environmental changes, such as deregulatory processes, are 
important attributes to a firm’s choice of strategic behavior since they provide both incumbents and new entrants 
with asymmetric opportunities and threats. In particular, deregulation that eliminates entry barriers tend to force 
incumbents to seek for more deterrent activities in order to maintain their current market positions (Grimm & 
Smith, 1997). Utilizing a strategic choice perspective, a firm’s choice of strategic actions is important in 
determining the firm’s performance in a changing environment. 

To further elaborate the dimension of different mix in developing firm’s strategic actions, the resource based 
view of the firm (RBV), an effort to explain competitive advantage as acquiring an ownership of scarce and 
valuable resources and the firm’s manipulating its resources, can be explored (Barney, 1991). Environmental 
changes require a firm to update a shared set of assumptions about resources, capabilities and objectives. In 
addition, a firm needs to be more flexible to uncertainties and update a shared set of assumptions about resources 
and capabilities (Clemons, 1997). A firm’s relative strategic position will be affected by the types of strategic 
actions that a firm implements. 

Often times, environmental changes (both deregulatory and technological changes) can be influenced by policy 
makers in the respective industry setting. For incumbents, they develop their own routines of strategic action 
behaviors to cope with such environmental changes. Nelson & Winter (1982) argued that routines were made up 
of the conscious and tacit knowledge and skills held by firms who carried out certain types of strategic activities 
more frequently. Levinthal & March (1993) also argued that a firm’s actions tended to be gradually rigid, narrow, 
and simple owing to the repeated use of their knowledge bases. Once the firm’s choice of strategic actions 
achieves success, their tendency is to continue to exploit their existing strategies that have worked in the past 
(Audia et al., 2000; Miller, 1994; Miller & Chen, 1994). In other words, organizational inertia (Hannan & 
Freeman, 1984) forces a firm to be less motivated to compete aggressively. This leads a firm to be inattentive to 
the intelligence gathering and information processing activities (Miller, 1994). Typically, the firm’s 
embeddedness in its institutional context is a basic reason for a firm’s resistance to change (Greenwood & 
Hinings, 1996). Thus, the more firms are coupled to a prevailing organizational template in a highly structured 
institutional context, the higher their resistance to change (Greenwood & Hinings, 1996). However, their 
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persistent and repetitive use of certain strategic action type(s) can be hampered when external conditions are 
changed to require alternative responses, a phenomenon known as a competency trap (Levitt & March, 1988). 
Organizational inertia may lead to self-destruction in not acquiring organizational legitimacy when major shifts 
in competitive, technological, social, and legal conditions impose the need to use new strategic actions in a 
timely manner (Audia et al., 2000; Reuf, 1997). 

2.1 Proactive vs. Reactive Actions 

As previously explained, prolonged deregulatory processes (Kim & Prescott, 2005) and the existing firms’ strong 
ties with influential regulatory bodies, incumbents are better equipped with appropriating their strategic actions 
in adapting to deregulatory changes. Along with deregulatory changes, technological changes are another 
dimension of environmental change firms should carefully consider for. Dowling et al. (1994) examined how 
technological changes had affected an industry’s structure. Technological changes establish the ground rules of 
competition and create alternative market behavior (Henderson, 1993). New technology triggers firms to 
consider strategic action changes (Christensen, 1997). The fast growing diffusions of new services have created a 
more intense competitive environment. Also, a significant number of firms have made a series of strategic 
alliances and engaged in significant merger and acquisition activities in order to be technologically innovative in 
the era of technological convergence. 

Siggelkow (2001) suggested that environmental changes could be classified with respect to the impacts they 
have on the industry landscape. This study applies the similar approach to look at firm’s willingness to take 
strategic actions in response to environmental changes. Based on the extensive literature discussed above, we 
may argue that firms adapt their strategic actions in response to environmental changes, and successful firms 
proactively or reactively adapt and frequently redefine their strategic actions in order to maintain their 
environmental alignment (Venkatraman & Prescott, 1990). This study will look at some specific hypotheses of a 
firm’s strategic action responses to deregulatory and technological changes. 

2.2 Hypotheses Development 

Hypotheses in this study focus on the different nature of a firm’s strategic response positioning to deregulatory 
and technological changes. Lengthy deregulatory processes (Kim & Prescott, 2005) and a firm’s strong ties to 
institutional building (Butler & Carney, 1986) enable firms to identify key issues and to overcome potential 
competitive risks in response to deregulatory changes. Ultimately, firms in particular for incumbents, will try to 
turn deregulatory changes to their advantages (Bailey, 1997). For instance, proactively-responding firms in the 
process of international expansion gain substantial first-mover advantages due to the transient nature of the 
windows of market opportunity and lengthy regulatory approval processes (Sarkar et al., 1999). On the other 
hand, technological changes are difficult to predict and often times radical in nature, and incumbents have a 
tendency to limit a number of strategic actions they consider for technological changes in advance. Incumbents’ 
prior commitment (Ghemawat, 1991) to the existing technologies may also delay a firm’s speedy response to the 
technological changes. Therefore, a firm takes a reactive strategic action positioning in response to technological 
changes. 

2.2.1 Proactive Strategic Responses to Deregulatory Changes 

Forms of deregulation impact on the speed of adaptation in various internal governance mechanisms (Kim & 
Prescott, 2005). Deregulation process in the telecom industry takes a long path to be effective, and firms, in 
particular for incumbents, play important roles in shaping the scope of deregulatory changes. As a result, a firm 
will be proactively involved with strategic actions when deregulatory changes occur, and a firm’s strategic 
actions will be increased even prior to the deregulatory events occur. The earlier firms get involved in the 
process of deregulatory changes, the more strategic influences they will have (Bailey, 1997) as firms generate a 
mix of strategic actions in advance to strengthen their capabilities (or maintain their market dominance). With 
incumbents’ strong ties to institutional building (Butler & Carney, 1986), they utilize the opening of policy 
window, a period when incumbents created the strategic use of information to shape a policy path in their favor 
(Bailey, 1997; Owen & Braeutigam, 1978). In other word, incumbents identify the key regulatory issues, 
overcome potential political difficulties by redrafting proposals, and thereby turn the politically propitious events 
to their advantages (Bailey, 1997).  

Depending upon the nature of deregulatory changes, a firm makes its strategic actions whether certain 
deregulatory changes create an incentive to join with competitors (improving collective advantages) or to be 
apart from competitors (improving relative advantages). Thus, a firm sets the stage to what extent deregulatory 
changes would be unfolded by proactively increasing its strategic actions prior to deregulatory changes became 
effective. For example, a firm with discernible market power and leadership positions proactively undertakes a 
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set of deterrent actions to achieve a competitive advantage (Grimm & Smith, 1997). Sarkar et al. (1999) argued 
that proactively-responding firms in the process of international expansion gained substantial first mover 
advantages due to the transient nature of the policy windows of market opportunity. 

Hypothesis 1 All else being equal, when deregulatory changes occur, a firm’s strategic actions will be more 
proactive 
2.2.2 Reactive Strategic Responses to Technological Changes 

In contrast, a firm has a difficult time predicting how fast technology changes are unfolded and have 
reconstructed the marketplace. Wireless service operators tend to wait and see what types of technology 
protocols will be dominating in the industry. As a result, a firm, particularly an incumbent, has limited options of 
strategic actions it could proactively consider to cope with technological changes. For incumbents, prior 
commitment (Ghemawat, 1991) to the existing technologies may also delay their responses because changing or 
even abandoning the existing resources and technological knowledge bases will receive stronger resistance both 
internally and externally. Unlike new entrants being aggressively innovative to new technologies in the 
marketplace, incumbents tend to be rather reactive in shifting their strategic actions. 

Also, upgrading infrastructure such as telecom networks requires firms to take longer time to install new 
technological standards. As a result, incumbents tend to take their strategic actions reactively until new 
technological changes are fully acknowledged in the market. Innovative technological changes may award 
proactive firms, however, a firm may wait and see what others would respond to technological changes. Since 
the introduction of wireless telecom services in early 1980s’, wireless technologies have undertaken a series of 
technological evolution from the analogue to the more efficient digital networks. Even among digital wireless 
technologies, different technology standards were introduced and upgraded in the market. Since it requires 
lengthy time and extreme amount of resources to deploy any new telecom infrastructure, a firm tends to be more 
reactive in taking strategic actions to upgrade its technologies when technological changes occur. Also, a firm 
takes rather conservative approaches in adapting its strategic actions to newer versions of wireless technology 
standards. 

Hypothesis 2 All else being equal, when technological changes occur, a firm’s strategic actions will be more 
reactive 
3. Method 

The empirical setting in this study is the US telecom industry for the 20-year period between 1984 and 2004. 
During these times, the US telecom industry has experienced major environmental changes driven by a series of 
deregulatory events and the introduction of new telecommunication technologies. All these environmental 
changes have redefined the fast-growing industry structure and competition, and reshuffle the key industry 
players tremendously. To name a few: AT&T was divested in 1984; in 1996, the Telecom Act 1934 was revised; 
wireless and Internet services became more popular with fast-growing number of subscribers and households. 
Also, convergence between telecom and broadcasting services made the industry boundaries more ambiguous 
and complex. All of these major environmental changes lowered entry barriers and caused strategic challenges to 
telecom service providers such as the RBOCs (Regional Bell Operating Companies) to look for main sources of 
growth. In response to these changes, this study looks at the various strategic actions of key incumbent telecom 
service providers such as the key RBOCs during the 20-year period between 1984 and 2004. Originally, there 
were 7 RBOCs that were formed from the 1984 breakup of AT&T. These are Bell Ameritech, Bell Atlantic, Bell 
South, Nynex, Pacific Telesis, SBC Communications and US West.  

3.1 Measures  

3.1.1 Deregulatory Change 

For deregulatory changes in this study, the revision of Telecom Act in 1996 is used. The revision was the most 
comprehensive deregulatory change that reshaped the telecom industry environment during the 20 year period. 
The year of 1996 was used as a year of deregulatory changes in this study. For example, it eliminated the 
regional coverage restrictions and allowed new entrants to serve the basic telecom services. According to Kim & 
Prescott (2005), form of deregulatory process in telecom industry was low in pace and scope, therefore, a firm’s 
strategic actions would be considered and executed in multiple-years. To count for such industry characteristics, 
several time ranges are used as dummy variables. For example, year 1994 (2 year minus from 1996) and year 
1998 (2 year plus from 1996) are used as ± 2 year window period to examine if frequency of firms’ strategic 
action portfolios change depending upon different pre- and post-time ranges when environmental changes occur. 
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3.1.2 Technological Change 

Among many other technological changes in this industry, the emergence of wireless technologies is the focus of 
this study. In the late 1990s, 3G wireless standards became more apparent as the next generation wireless 
technology in the industry. As a result, key telecom operators began to consider more strategic actions in order to 
deploy more advanced wireless technologies and services. The year of 2000 was used as a year of technological 
changes in this study. It was the year when the annual total number of wireless subscribers outnumbered those of 
the fixed-line telephony subscribers for the first time. It was one of the major technological shifts, showing the 
signs of increasing growth rate of new telecom technologies and services such as wireless and the high-speed 
Internet services. To cope with such shifts, telecom operators had to consider modifying their corporate strategic 
action portfolios in order to sustain their sustainable competitive advantages. Another technological 
characteristic during the same period is that different communication technologies have begun to converge with 
each other. To name a few, VoIP (Voice over Internal Protocol) and CATV providers can now serve traditional 
telephony through different communication platform. Technological convergence forces incumbents (e.g. 
RBOCs) to formulate their strategic actions by rearranging their resource pools in anticipation of competing 
against new entrants. Similar to deregulatory change dummy variables, several time ranges are used as 
technological change dummy variables. For example, year 1998 (2 year minus from 2000) and year 2002 (2 year 
plus from 2000) are used as ± 2 year window period to examine if frequency of firms’ strategic action portfolios 
change depending upon different pre- and post-time ranges when technological changes occur. 

3.1.3 Corporate Strategic Actions 

Main variables capturing the level of corporate strategic action in this study are frequency and variety of 
strategic action portfolios. Measures for these two attributes are adopted from those of Miller & Chen (1996) and 
Gnyawali et al. (2006). In addition, some industry-specific and firm-specific control variables are added to 
control the relationships between a firm’s strategic action portfolios and environmental changes. Strategic 
alliance actions include a broader range of firm’s partnering with other firms from equity partnerships to the long 
term marketing relationships. As long as any RBOCs are involved in the strategic alliance transactions, all of 
their domestic and foreign alliances are entered into the sample. Mergers and acquisition actions include when 
any of the seven RBOCs acquire more than 50% of other firm’s total equity (or assets). The same reasoning is 
applied to divestiture actions when the seven RBOCs divest any of their existing businesses (or assets) to others. 
In addition, the seven RBOCs’ actions are further categorized into firm size (RBOCs vs. non-RBOCs), service 
scope (SIC 4813 vs. non-SIC 4813) and geographic location (domestic vs. foreign). These detailed 
categorizations can be applied to code different dimensions of corporate strategic actions. Both the total annual 
count and the dollar amount measures of corporate strategic actions at their effective date are considered in this 
study. 

3.1.3.1 Frequency of Corporate Strategic Action 

Frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios is the total number (or annual dollar values) of a firm’s 
corporate strategic actions in a given year (Miller & Chen, 1996; Gnyawali et al., 2006). Three major corporate 
strategic actions—strategic alliance, merger and acquisition, and divestiture actions will be individually counted 
to measure the frequency of a firm’s corporate strategic action portfolios. For some specific strategic actions, it 
takes more than a year from the announcement of the individual strategic action to the actual effective date. In 
this study, the effective date of strategic actions is considered for annual action counts. And then, they are 
summed up in counts and dollar values. 

Frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios for firm i = ∑ N ik 

where Nik refers to the number of four corporate strategic actions that firm i undertook in a given year. 

3.1.3.2 Variety of Corporate Strategic Action 

Variety of corporate strategic action portfolios is the range of strategic actions undertaken by a firm across 
different corporate strategic actions (Miller & Chen, 1996; Gnyawali et al., 2006). Gnyawali et al. (2006) defined 
the competitive variety as the range of actions undertaken by a firm across the various aspects of the value chain. 
Miller & Chen (1996) defined the concentration index based on the standard deviation of the standard scores 
across the 21 types of actions for an airline in a given year, and this standard deviation was standardized by 
dividing the total number of actions in order to adjust for the firm-size differences (p. 427). 

Variety of corporate strategic action portfolios for firm i = 1-∑ (Nij / Ni)
2 

where Ni, j is the number of actions in the jth aspect of four corporate strategic actions for firm i; thus, (Ni, j /Ni) 
is the proportion of each corporate strategic actions from the corporate strategic action portfolios for i. If firm is 
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focusing on a single corporate action type, variety of action portfolios will be close to zero. 

3.1.4 Control Variables 

In order to control potential compounding impacts, the research added several control variables in its testing 
model. Each RBOC’s total asset (tasset) and operating income (opincome) are in use to control their sizes. Also, 
each RBOC’s major serving areas, measured as the number of the top 100 MSAs (Metropolitan Statistical Area) 
each RBOC serves (wsub), and the number of competitors in each RBOC’s region (nrival) are used to control 
market structures Also, the growth of annual GDP (pcpincome) and annual population (uspop) are included in 
this study. Summary statistics of each variable are also shown in Table 1. 

3.2 Analytical Method 

Previous research has taken different approaches to study the impact of environmental changes on a firm’s 
strategic actions. The methods includes 1) event study method (Harrison, 2006), 2) case method, 3) event history 
method, 4) a visual mapping method (Webb & Pettigrew, 1999), and ANOVA (Elsbach, 19905). 

For the impacts of environmental changes on firm’s frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios, this study 
has extensively utilized the dummy variable regression with least squares dummy variables (LSDV) estimator. 
Since this study focuses on the corporate strategic action portfolios of the seven RBOCs, using the LSDV 
method is a practical proposition given the need for a small number of dummy variables. In other word, the 
LSDV estimator is practical only when N is small. In order to use the LSDV estimator, frequency and variety of 
firms’ unique corporate strategic action portfolios are separately converted into the natural logarithm and 
quadratic forms respectively. 

Frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios i = β0 + β1 firm-specific variable +δ year dummy variable it + 
ε 
Variety of corporate strategic action portfolios i = β0 + β1 firm-specific variable +δ year dummy variable it + ε 
The occurrence of a firm’s strategic actions will be proactively frequent even before deregulatory changes occur 
as tested in H1. On the other hand, the occurrence of a firm’s strategic actions will be reactively frequent after 
technological changes occur as tested in H2. These two hypotheses are tested with the LSDV estimator. To 
examine a firm’s proactiveness vs. reactiveness of strategic actions in response to environmental changes, 
different time frames with t±2 years of deregulatory and technological changes will be considered as dummy 
variables to see if they show significantly different coefficients in the regression model. In this study, for 
deregulatory changes, I look at the frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios with t±2 year (1994-96 and 
1996-98) dummies. For technological changes, another t±2 year (1998-2000 and 2000-2002) dummies are taken 
to compare with the frequency of corporate strategic action portfolios. Both count and dollar measures are used 
to test these hypotheses. 

4. Results 
For proactive versus reactive strategic responses to environmental changes, a firm’s corporate strategic actions 
tend to be more proactive when deregulatory changes occur, and to be more reactive when technological changes 
occur. Proactive strategic responses to deregulatory changes are supported in this study. Corporate strategic 
actions in count measure are more frequent even prior to a change in deregulation. When both pre-event and 
post-event periods are compared, the standardized coefficient for pre-event period is 5.011 while the 
standardized coefficient for post-event period is 2.190 when count measure is tested. Even though both 
coefficients are significant at the 10% level, the frequency of a firm’s corporate actions are twice more likely in 
the pre-event period. I compare the coefficients of pre-event period with post-event period to test the null 
hypothesis, H0: b pre-event period = b post-event period. The F value is 5.42 and is significant at the 5% level, indicating 
that the coefficient of pre-event period is significantly different from the coefficient of post-event period. The 
larger coefficient of the pre-event period indicates that a firm’s strategic actions will be more proactive when 
deregulatory changes occur. Frequency of corporate strategic actions in dollar measure shows the meaningful 
significance when changes in deregulation. 

Furthermore, variety of a firm’s corporate strategic actions shows consistent results. A firm takes various types of 
strategic actions proactively even before deregulatory changes occur. Thus, this study finds proactive strategic 
responses in the variety of a firm’s corporate strategic actions when deregulatory changes occur. The significance 
levels are at the 5% both in count and dollar measures, but the differences in the coefficients of pre-event and 
post-event periods are much smaller when variety of a firms’ corporate strategic actions are tested in H1. It is due 
to the fact that several mega-billion dollar M&A deals have been made just after deregulatory changes in 1996, 
and these excessive financial commitments have some effects on the significance level. During the pre-1996 
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reiterates the importance of the firm’s strategic adaptation mechanism in response to two external environmental 
changes. Both regulatory and technological changes increasingly shape the structure and conduct of industries 
and sets in motion major shifts in economic value (Beardsley et al., 2005). Effectively navigating these changing 
processes could allow incumbents not only to manage risks embedded in regulatory and technological changes 
better but also to stir their industries and to create potential opportunities for themselves (Beardsley et al., 2005). 

The above results should be noted with some interesting implications. First, technological changes can be very 
complex processes that a firm’s choices of considering different corporate strategic actions will be different 
depending upon the nature of technological changes. For example, Lavie (2006) presented three mechanisms of 
capability reconfiguration—substitution, evolution, and transformation—that analyzed the incumbents’ 
responses to technological changes. To some extent, the impact of technological changes can be tested on a 
continuous basis, not as a single event impacting on firms’ corporate strategic actions. This argument is very 
much applicable to the field of telecom service industry since we have experienced a significant amount of 
technological advancement and convergence during the last decade from 2004 to 2017. It will be worthwhile to 
replicate this study with the current strategic actions and regulatory and technological initiatives taken from the 
diverse pool of US Information, Communication, and Technology (ICT) firms of today. 

Second, competitive speed refers to how quickly firms act in the event of environmental changes (Nayyar & 
Bantel, 1994), and this study looks at the proactive versus reactive responses to deregulatory and technological 
changes. A firm’s capability to act proactively is likely to achieve superior performance (Lee et al., 2000). 
However, to perform speedy strategic actions, firms should consider additional costs that arise from the potential 
pitfalls of deciding too early before uncertainty has been adequately resolved or appropriate measures have been 
taken to guard against unforeseen events (Wernerfelt & Karnani, 1987). As a result, firms will take reactive 
responses of their strategic actions to certain environmental changes. 

This study shows rather interesting results in regards to a firm’s proactive versus reactive responses to 
environmental changes. Since incumbents (RBOCs in this study) have long history of close ties with the 
regulators in the US telecom industry, they have better positions to prepare for such deregulatory changes. As a 
matter of fact, all RBOCs were active participants in numerous policy making forums and the congressional 
hearings before 1996 Telecom Act was revised and passed in the Congress. Also, lengthy deregulatory process 
provided them to proactively response to deregulatory changes. The results in this study confirm that a firm’s 
strategic actions (both frequency and variety of corporate strategic action portfolios) will be more proactive 
when deregulatory changes occur. 

On the other hand, when technological changes occur, a firm’s strategic actions are not reactive. However, it 
should be noted that the firm’s reactive strategic responses to technological changes are significant when dollar 
measure is used. Firms will wait and see what others do when technological changes are involved with the 
likelihood of additional costs associated with executing strategic actions proactively. In particular, significant 
strategic commitments such as corporate strategic actions in this study will force firms to respond reactively to 
technological changes. 
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